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6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short bed (no outside fenders) extended, club, super UNIT PRICE 21,689.00 22,236.00 22,386.87 22,725.00 22,885.00 23,511.00 23,524.00 23,738.00 23,822.00 23,891.80 23,949.00 25,847.00
cab pickup trucks, per specifications TOTAL 672,359.00 689,316.00 693,992.97 704,475.00 709,435.00 728,841.00 729,244.00 735,878.00 738,482.00 740,645.80 742,419.00 801,257.00
2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Toyota Tundra
Manufacturer Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Silverado Silverado Silverado Silverado 2016 Ford F150 2016 Ford F150 Silverado 2016 Ford F150 Silverado 2016 Ram 1500 Double Cab
A. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 90-120 days 90-120 days 100-120 days 84 days 90-120 days 75-90 days 60-120 days 90-120 days 60-75 days 60-90 days 75-90 days 90-120 days
2 ea. X
6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside), extended, club UNIT PRICE 25,488.00 25,768.00 26,595.00 27,455.00 28,063.00 27,311.00 26,482.00 28,083.00 27,087.00 27,571.80 27,209.00 31,468.00
super cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 50,976.00 51,536.00 53,190.00 54,910.00 56,126.00 54,622.00 52,964.00 56,166.00 54,174.00 55,143.60 54,418.00 62,936.00
2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Toyota Tundra
State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Silverado Silverado Silverado Silverado 2016 Ford F150 2016 Ford F150 Silverado 2016 Ford F150 Silverado 2016 Ram 1500 Double Cab
B. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 90-120 days 90-120 days 100-120 days 84 days 90-120 days 75-90 days 60-120 days 90-120 days 60-75 days 60-90 days 75-90 days 90-120 days
5ea. x
5,200 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short type bed (no fender outside), extended, access, UNIT PRICE 21,630.00 22,824.00 23,247.00 DOES NOT 22,202.00 23,987.36 21,446.00
super cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 108,150.00 NO BID 114,120.00 116,235.00 NO BID NO BID MEET NO BID 111,010.00 119,936.80 NO BID 107,230.00
2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Chevrolet SPECIFICATIONS 2016 Chevrolet 2016 Toyota Tacoma
State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Colorado Colorado Colorado 2016 King Cab Nissan Colorado Access Cab
C. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 90-120 days 110-120 days 60-120 days 150-175 days 60-90 days 90-120 days
Net Net Net Net Net Net Net Net Net Net 2% Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 days 30 days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Bluebonnet Chrysler Dodge Lone Star Chrysler Demandstar
Caldwell Country Ford North Park Toyota SAWS Website

Five Star Chevrolet

Five Star Ford

Grande Ford

Grande Truck Center
Grapevine Chrysler Jeep Dodge
Gunn Fleet

Jim Bass Ford

Jordan Ford

Red McCombs Toyota Ford
Silshee Fleet

Silsbee Ford

Superior Buick Chevrolet
Tom Benson Chevroleet
Toyota

Toyota of Boerne

Toyota Scion




